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1 

Recent Trends in Global Financial Flows 

SINCE the breakdown of the Bretton Woods system of fixed exchange 

rates in the early 1970s, the phenomenal increase in global financial flows 

is the most significant development in the world economy. Globaljzation 

of finance is not a new phenomenon as there was massive cross border 

movement of capital without any restrictions for 50 years prior to the First 

World War ( 1914-18). But the stupendous increase in global financial 

flows in both absolute terms and pace of movement in the post-Bretton 

Woods period has been unparaUeled and as such has given rise to serious 

concern among policy makers and observers. The growing global finan­

cial integration could be gauged from the exponential rise in the volume 

of foreign exchange trading. According to the BIS, which monJtors t rans­

acti ons in the world's foreign exchange markets, $1.49 trillion 

($ 1490,000,000,000) is traded on an average every single day. 
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l :tjDll 
Bretton Woods System 

In July 1944, the procedure for fixing exchange rate and managing inter­
national financial system was worked out at a conference held in Bretton 
Woods, a town in New Hampshire in the US. The Bretton Woods system 
was designed to ensure that domestic economic objectives were not sub­
ordinated to global financial pressures. Under the Bretton Woods system, 
all countries were required to fix exchange rate to the US dollar, and the 
dollar was fixed in terms of gold at $35 an ounce. 

Since the US emerged as the leading power after World War II, the dollar 
replaced the sterling as the dominant currency for exchange. Under this 
system, private financial flows were regulated by capital controls and an 
international institution, IMF, was set up to monitor the international 
financial system that was largely dominated by official capital flows. The 
Bretton Woods system was not universal in its outreach as the commu­
nist bloc was not part of it. 

However, the rise of Eurocurrency market in the 1960s put strains on the 
Bretton Woods system. The system suffered a major breakdown on Au­
gust 15, 1971 when the US - which was unable to deal with a massive 
speculative attack on the dollar in the wake of growing balance of pay­
ments deficit largely caused by the protracted Vietnam War - unilater­
ally declared that it would no longer honor its commitment to exchange 
dollars for gold at $35 per ounce. For some time, a few countries at­
tempted to create alternatives (e.g., the Smithsonian Agreement) to the 
defunct Bretton Woods system. But on February 12, 1973, Japan decided 
to float the yen against the dollar, and on March 16, 1973, the European 
Community followed suit. Thereafter, the remaining countries took re­
course to either floating or flexible exchange rate system. 

Undoubtedly, this system was based on the hegemony of the US as it 
served the country's foreign policy and economic interests. Surely, the 
motive was not altruism on the part of the US but was based on the 
expectation that the country had much more to gain from managing 
international financial system. Despite its several shortcomfogs, this sys­
tem provided adequate financial stability and economic growth for a 

considerable period. 
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In the initial years of the Bretton Woods system, international flow of 
capital was heavily controlled. For instance, it was not possible for a 
British investor to buy American stocks or bonds. The bulk of external 
capital available to developing countries was in the form of official aid 
and grant. FOi flows to developing countries, other than for exploitation 

of natural resources, were extremely low while commercial bank lending 
and portfolio investment flows were almost nonexistent. By the early 
1960s, markets had found ways for circumventing some of these controls 
through the growth of'Euromarkets,' where banks located in one country 

could take deposits and m ake loans in the currencies of other countries. 
After the collapse of the fixed exchange rate system in the early 1970s, the 
developed countries led by the EEC and the OECD countries gradually 
started dismantling controls on capital movement. The US soon followed 
suit to attract capital inflows, particularly from Germany and Japan. 

The oil shock of 1973-7 4 soon followed leading to heavy surpluses in 
oil-exporting countries and corresponding deficits in oil-importing coun­
tries. Many oil-exporting countries preferred to keep surplus fu nds in 
Western commercial banks, which then needed investment outlets. They 
turned to the developing countries (particuJarly the Latin American 

countries) that were anxious to borrow funds to tide over balance of 
payments deficits. Thus, the recycling of' petrodollars' from the surplus to 
deficit countries via the Eurocurrency market created a significant surge 
in global financial flows. Net flows to developing countries from com­
mercial banks reached their peak by the late 1970s. 

The excessive build up of external loans in the developing countries 
coupled with higher interest rates in the developed countries triggered the 
debt crisis as many developing countries were unable to service their huge 
external debts. There is no disagreement with the observation that several 
countries had mismanaged the use of external funds so much so that a 
major chunk of these funds were diverted towards conspicuous con­
sumption or simply disappeared into the pockets of politicians and offi­
cials. Only a minor proportion went into productive invesunents. But, at 

the same time, international banks cannot be absolved of their role in 
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perpetuating the debt crisis as they relaxed their credit criteria in order to 
reap huge profits from the recycling of ' petrodollars.' In 1982, when 
Mexico announced a moratorium on its repayment, the internationaJ 
banks realized thar they were in thick soup as other developing countries 
in Latin America facing similar problems might follow suit. As heavy 
exposures to indebted countries was posing a threat to the Western bank­
ing system, severaJ debt management packages (e.g., Baker Plan and 
Brady Plan) were set in motion by the developed countries and interna­
tional financial institutions and groupings, particularly the IMF and the 
Paris Club, to rescue commercial banks. Consequently, the developing 
countries were net recipients of global financial flows in the early 1980s. 
Jn other words, new loans to the developing countries exceeded interest 
payments and repayments of principal. However, with the beginning of 
debt crisis in 1982, this pattern was completely reversed, as there were 
substantial net transfers from the developing to the developed countries. 
During the Latter half of the 1980s, foreign capital flowed mainly within 

the developed countries. 

In the aftermath of the debt crisis, the implementation of structural 
adjustment programs in several Latin American countries led to large­
scale private capital inflows. With emphasis on privatization, liberaliza­
tion and removal of controls on capital account, adjustment programs 
facilitated a renewed surge in global financial flows to several Latin 
American countries, particularly Mexico and Chile. In the case of Mexico, 
NAFTA also played a crucial role in facilitating capital inflows. The 
region witnessed a sharp increase in capitaJ inflows, from $53 billion in 
1995 to $74 billion in t 996. A large part of this increase emanated from 
equity flows through depository receipts and investments by institutional 
investors. 

Apart from the Latin American countries. the greatest recipients of 
financial flows were the Southeast Asian countries known as 'Asian 

Tigers.' However, the reasons for capital inflows in the SoutJ1east Asian 
countries were entirely different from the Latin American countries, as 
much of the financial flows were directed towards setting up of assembling 
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and manufacturing facilities in these countries. As the currencies of 

'Asian Tigers' were generally pegged to the dollar, they benefited from the 

rise of Yen against the dollar following the f>laza Accord of 1985. The 

euphoria created by the global investment community in the J 990s was 

so higb that countries previously known as developing or third world 

countries earned the epithet of emerging markets. 

Global Financial Flows to the Developing Countries in the 1990s 

One of the most striking developments regarding global financial flows is 
the radical change in their configuration in the 1990s, particularly in the 

context of developing countries. Based on the data published by the 

World Bank in its various publications including Global Development 
Finance 1999, some of these trends and developments are summarized 
here. 

Table 1. 1: Net Long-term Resource Flows to Developing Countries 

( 1990-98) ($billion) 

1990 1994 1995 1996 1997 1998" 

Net long-term resource flows 100.8 223.6 254.9 308. J 338.l 275.0 

Official flows 56.9 45.5 53.4 32.2 39.l 47.9 

Private flows 43.9 178.1 20 1. 5 275.9 299.0 227.l 

From international capital markets 19.4 89.6 96.l 149.5 135.5 72.1 

Private debt flows 15.7 54.4 60.0 100.3 105.3 58.0 

Commercial banks 3.2 13.9 32.4 43.7 60.l 25.1 

Bonds 1.2 36.7 26.6 53.5 42.6 30.2 

Others l 1.4 J.7 l.O 3.0 2.6 2.7 

Portfolio equity flows 3.7 35.2 36.1 49.2 30.2 14. l 

Foreign direct investment 24.5 88.5 105.4 126.4 163.4 155.0 

Note: Net long-term resource tlows are defined as net liability transactions of original 
maturity greater than one year. Although the Republic of Korea i$ h.igh-iocome country, ii 
is included in the developing country aggregate since it is a borrower from the World Bank. 
· Preliminary. 

Source: World Uauk. Glubal De1•elup111en1 Fma11re 1999. 1999, p. 14. 



6 Taming Global Financial FlOlvs 

• Net long- term financial flows to the developing countries, both pri­
vate and official, increased from $100 billion in 1990 to $338 billion in 
1997. However, it declined to $275 billion in 1998 due to the Southeast 
Asian financial crisis and its contagion effects (see Table 1.1 ). In 1997, the 
developing countries made a net transfer of financial resources abroad to 
the tune of $27 billion - the first negative transfer since 1990. 

• Private capital flows dominate the total financiaJ flows to the develop­
ing countries. Out of the $338 billion of total financial flows in 1997, 
private flows accounted for $299 billion, nearly 88 per cent of the total 
flows. 

• Official capital flows, both bilateral and multilateral, are on the de­
cline, from $56 billion in 1990 to $39 billion in 1997, OfficiaJ flows are, 
however, critical to the economies of several African countries. Most of 
them still remain dependent on official capital flows to meet their re­
quirement of external finance_ 

• The bulk of private capital flows are highly concentrated, with a dozen 
countries receiving nearly three-quarters of capital inflows during the 
period 1990-97, while 140 of the 166 developing countries accounted for 
less than 5 per cent of total flows during the same period. China is the 
leacling developing country which has attracted substantial amount of 
private capHaJ flows, particularly FDI, in the nineties. As mentioned 
earlier, the recent surge in private capital flows which occurred in Latin 
America and Southeast Asia has largely bypassed Sub-Saharan Africa 
(except South Africa). 

• In the 1990s, a substantial part of private capital flows has gone to the 
private sector as compared to the governments just a decade ago. 

• FDl flows have emerged as the most important component of p rivate 
capital flows and remains predominant despite several financial crises in 
the 1990s. 

• Flows from international capital markets (portfolio investments, bonds 

and bank loans) have increased considerably in the 1990s, from $19 
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billion in 1990 to S 149 billion in 1996. Portfolio jnvestment (PI), which 

was negligible during the 1970s and 1980s, became sizeable in the early 

1990s. From $3 billion in 1990, PI flows increased to $49 billion by 1996. 

Borrowings through commercial bank loans have also registered an in­
crease. It was $43 biJlion in J 996, an increase of $12 billion from 1995. 

The majority of borrowers of commercial bank lending belong to the 

private sector, accounting fo r nearly 60 per cent of all new Joans during 

1995-96. Another noticeable aspect of commercial bank lending is that 

nearly half of it is used to finance mega infrastructure projects like power, 

highways, etc. Given the extreme volatility associated with such financial 

flows, the flows from international capital markets declined from $135 

billion in 1997 to $72 billion in 1998 in the wake of the Southeast Asian 

financial crisis. 

• Flows from international capital markets have been highly concen ­

trated in the mjddJe-income countries, which received more than 90 per 

cent of these flows during the 1990s. 

Factors Behind the Surge in Global Financial Flows 

A number of factors, both external and internal, have contributed to the 

increase in global financial flows. Some of the key factors are discussed in 

the succeeding pages. Needless to add, these are the contributory factors, 

which have engendered volatility and instability in the global financial 

system. 

Global Financial Liberalization 

Financial liberalization in both the developed and the developing countries 

is perhaps the most important factor behind increased capital mobility on 

a global scale. Although a detailed analysis of financial liberalization and 

its consequences is given in the next two chapters, a brief introduction 

may suffice here. Financial liberalization has two interrelated components, 

domestic and international. Domestic financial liberalization encourages 

market forces by reducing the role of the state in the financial sector. This 

is achieved by removing controls on interest rates and credit allocation as 
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well as by diluting demarcation Lines between banks, insurance and 

finance companies. 

Internauonal financial liberalization, on the other hand, demands 

removal of controls and regulations on both the inflows and outflows of 

capital. By allowing cross border movement of capital, it promotes global 

financial integration. Due to increased global financial integration, the 

flow of funds is no longer unidirectional. Capital is not only flowing from 

the developed to developing countries but also from the developing 
countries (e.g., Mexico, Chile and Thailand) to the rest of the world. 

Developed countries were the first to embark on the process of financial 

liberalization. Foreign exchange markets took the lead to liberalize in the 

late 1970s. The liberalization of capital account was followed by 

Liberalization of bond markets in the 1980s, and equity markets in the 

1990s. In addition, the growing institutionalization of savings in the 

developed countries has given rise to institutional investors who are both 

willin g and able to invest in global financial markets. Much of financial 

a sets in developed countries are now finding their way into mutual 

funds, hedge funds, pension funds and investment trusts rather than 

banks. For instance, in 1980, banks handled 58 per cent of savings and 

investment transactions in the US economy, and institutional investor!> 

held a 31 per cent market share. By 1994, the banks' proportion had fallen 

to 33 per cent and that of institutional investors had jumped to 44 per 

cent. 1 

Since rhe 1980s, the size and the structure of financial markets of 

developing countries have also undergone rapid changes. Deregulation of 

domestic financial markets along with liberalization of capital account 

have been important components ofrhe adjustment programs supported 

by the World Bank and the IMF. During 1991-93, 11 developing countries 

undertook full or extensive liberalization of thejr exchange restrictions; 

23 Liberalized controls on FDI flows; 15 eased controls on portfolio 

inflows; and 5 eased restrictions on portfolio outflows. By the end of 1995, 

35 developing countries had fully open capital accounts. A significant 

part of the surge in foreign equity financing has been associated with the 
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privatization of public sector companies in the developing countries (e.g., 

Argentina), whicb also happens to be an important component of the 

adjustment program:.. The number of countries that are classified as 

highly integrated increased from 2 in 1985-87 to 13 in 1992-94, whereas 

the number of countries classified as moderately integrated increased 

from 24 to 26.2 

Apart from the structural adjustment program, several international 

agreements have also promoted financial liberalization in the developing 

countries. For instance, financial liberalization is an important component 

of the WTO agreement on financial services concluded in 1997 and the 

lMF's Article Vlll obligations of convertibility of currencies for current 

account transactions. Under the WTO agreement on financial services, 

which came into effect from March 1998, 70 of its member-countries 

agreed to open up their financiaJ services sector. This agreement brings 

trade in financial services - worth trilHons of dollars - under the 

WTO's rules on a pennanent and full most favored nation (MFN) basis. 

By this agreement, countries representing over 95 per cent of the trade in 

banking, insurance, securities, asset management and financ ial 

information, have brought financial services into the realm of international 

rules. While the number of countries which have accepted the IMF's 

Article VITI has increased sharply from 35 in l 970 (which was only 30 per 

cent of the membership of the IMF) to 137 in early 1997 (76 per cent of its 

member hip).' 

Over-capacity and Overproduction 

From the beginning of the 1980s, the economies of the developed countries 

are suffering from over-capacity and overproduction in manufacturing. 

Their problems have been further compounded by the intrusion of the 

'Asian Tigers' into the world markets during the 1980s and the 1990s. 

With ao major expansion in the world's markets taking place, capital is 

looking for alternative profitable opportun ities. As mentioned earlier, the 

global financial markets are expanding exponentially. Since profits can 

be made quickly in financial markets, much of the capital is shifting away 
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from investment in production to investment in financial markets and 

specuJative financial instruments. This shift in international economy 

has become more apparent in the 1990s. 

H istorically, wealth was created when income was diverted from 

consumption into investment in machinery. buildings and technological 

change. Nowadays, securitization - the issuance of stocks and bonds -

has become the new instrument of wealth creation. As financial logic 

becomes more important than productive logic, the managers and owners 

of business corporations are more concerned with rewarding their 

shareholders in order to boost the value of shares in the financial markets. 

Many tend to sacrifice long-term investment goals for short -term profits 

and higher stock prices. In fact, several manufacturing firms have also 

started financial subsidiaries in order to benefit from finance capital. The 

General Electric Capital Services (GE Capital) - a subsidiary of the 

world's largest TNC, General Electric (GE) - is a classic example of this 

trend. With $255 billion in assets worldwide. GE Capital is a major player 

in global financial markets. In 1997, it contributed as much as 40 per cent 

to the parent company's total income.• A recent entrant into financial 

services is UPS Capital, a subsidiary of United Parcel Service, the world's 

largest courier company. 

low International Interest Rates 

Among the external factors, perhaps the most important one is the relatively 

low real rates of return available on investments in the major developed 

economies from where large funds originate. For the past so many years, 

the interest rates are extremely low in the developed countries as compared 

to the developing countries. For instance, interest rates on treasury bills 

in the US are in the range of 4. to 5 per cent while long-term interest rates 

in Japan are perhaps the lowest in the world, i.e., less than l per cent. This 

prompts investors in developed countries to seek alternative markets for 
their investments in the developing countries where the interest rates are 

much higher. 
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Technological Advances 

Major advances in the technological field, especially in communications 

and information, have played a supportive role in the globalization of 

financial markets. The influence of technological advances has broken 

the natural barriers of space and time as twenty-four hours trading is 

possible now, which was not the case a decade ago. Virtual stock exchanges 

are no longer a dream, thanks to advances in Internet technology. The 

'electronic money' has added momentum to capital mobility as funds 

can be transferred globally with much ease and speed with the help of 

globally linked electronic monitors. With the help of SWIFT payments 

system, billions are transferred every day.s The advances in 

communica tions have drastically reduced the costs in moving money 

around the world. Wire-transfer systems such as FedWire and CHIPS 

(Clearing House Interbank Payments System) are also commonly used 

worldwide. With the adoption of international Accounting Standards 

(lAS), uniformity in accounting standards will soon become a reality 

thereby further facilitating the cross border movement of capital. However, 

technological advances have also increased the speed at which market 

shocks are transmitted nationally and globally. Earlier, market shocks 

used to take days and weeks to spread from one country to another, now 

they can be transmitted instantly. 

The Domination of Finance Capital over the Real Economy 

Due to the cumulative impact of the factors cited above, the global financial 

system has undergone tremendous change and has become much more 

complex and unruly than it was twenty years ago. New financial 

instruments and financial intermediaries have not only drastically 

changed the landscape but also the basic function of the global financial 

system. Much less regulated than the reaJ economy, the financial economy 

has outgrown the real economy and has considerably blurred the existent 

relationship. The global financial markets have moved beyond their original 

function of facilitating cross border trade and investment. The financial 

markets are no longer a mechanism for making savings available for 
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productive investments. Nowadays, global financial flows are less 

associated with the flows of real resources and long- term productive 

investments. 

As the value of global foreign exchange trade is many times more 

than the value of annual world trade and output, much of global finance 

capital is moving in search of quick profits from speculative activities 

rather than contributing to the real economy. Since 1980, the global stock 

of financial assets (shares, bonds, bank deposits and cash) has increased 

more than twice as fast as the GDP of rich economies, from $12 trillion in 

1980 to almost $80 trillion today.i. 

The swift cross border movement of capital has very little to do with 

the national or the world allocation of capital funds. Every day, trillions of 

dollars move in the world's financial markets in search of profit making 

opportunities from speculative investments. These flows are largely liquid 

and are attracted by short-term speculative gains, and can leave the cow1try 

as quickly as they come. It bas been calculated that over 80 per cent of spot 

forex turnover have a maturity of less than seven days.7 CommerciaJ and 

merchant banks, in addition to hedge funds, carry out most of the arbitrage 

and speculative dealing in foreign exchange and monl!y markets. 

Although not much attention has been paid, the globalization of 

finance can give rise to serious social, economic and political problems. 

According to Phil Cerny, the global finance capital "calls the tune for the 

reaJ economy ... it has developed its own autonomous structuraJ dynamic, 

a dynamic with rego'lrd to which international politics has yet to find a 

workable consensus on objectives or a feasible method of control."~ There 

are several ways in which the domination of finance capital negatively 

affects the real economy. Firscly. by providing economic incentives to 

gamble and speculate on financial instrumencs, the global finance capital 

diverts funds from long-term productive investments. According to Susan 

Strange, the real economy of manufacturing, services like entertainment, 

tourism, transport. mining, farming and retailing - all of it dances to the 

fast or slow rhythms of financial markets.9 Secondly, it encourages banks 

and financial institutions to maintain a regime of higher real interest 
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rates which significantly reduces the ability of productive industries aod 

enterprises in terms of access to credit. Thirdly, finance capital (because 

of its speculative nature) brings uncertainty and volatility in interest and 

exchaoge rates. This volatili ty is extremely harmful to various sectors of 

the real economy, particularly trade. Lastly, it undermines efforts by 

governments to support fuU employment and reduce inequality. 

In order to arrive at a better understanding of the operations of global 

finance capital, some of its key features as well as recent developments are 

outlined here. 

Foreign Exchange Trading: Scaling Unprecedented Heights 

The foreign exchange market is the largest market in the world today. As 

mentioned earlier, over $1.49 trillion is traded on an average every single 

day, whereas in 1977, the daily turnover in forex markets was just $ 18 

billion. Since the breakdown ofBretton Woods system in the early 1970s, 

forex transactions have increased several times (see Table 1.2). Quite 

often, analysts tend to undere rimate the signiJicance and power of foreign 

exchange and money markets. 1t would be a serious mistake to 

underestimate the importance of these markets because the price at which 

Table 1.2: Daily Global ForexTumover, 1977-98 
($billion) 

Year 

1977 

1980 

1983 

198(, 

1989 

1992 

199.5 

1998 

Daily Turnover 

18.3 

82.S 

Jl9.0 

270.0 

590.0 

820.0 

1190.0 

H90.0 

Source: Bank for International Settlemenr~ . 
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l :fflfj 
Foreign Exchange Trading 

Foreign exchange is traded over- the-counter (OTC) twenty-four hours a 

day. OTC transactions arc those that take place between two counterparties 

located anywhere in the world via a telephone or electronically rather than 

traded on an exchange. The main methods of forex trading are via direct 

interbank using systems (e.g., Reuters Dealing 2000-1), voice brokers and 

electronic broking systems (e.g., Reuters Dealing 2000-2). Some forcx in­
struments are also traded on exchanges such as currency futures at the 

Chicago Mercantile Exchange and currency options at the Philadelphia 

Stock Exchange. 

There are three broad categories of instruments and transactions in forex 

trading - spot transactions, forward transactions and derivatives (see 

diagram below). Spot transaction is a deal in which two counterparties 

exchange two different currencies at an agreed exchange rate for settlement 

Foreign Exchange Instruments 

FX Transactions 

Spot PX 

• Currencies vs US$ 
• Cross rates 

Synthetic Agreements 
for Foreign Exchange 
(SAFEs) 

ForwardFX 

Forward Outright 
Transactions 

Currency 
Futures 

Currency 
Swaps 

Derivatives 

FXSwaps 

Currency 
Options 

contd. on next page 
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in two-business days time. In 1998, spot transactions amounted to 40 per 
cent of the daily turnover of foreign exchange, down from 44 per cent in 
1995. Forward transactions involve purchase or sale of foreign exchange 
estabHshed now but with payment and delivery at a specified future date. 
These transactions are derived from spot forex and money market inter­
est rates. The two types of fonvard forex transactions used widely in the 
markets are forward outright transactions and fore.x swaps. In the past 
few years. forward transactions have grown in importance relative to 
spot transactions. Of the $1.49 trillion daily turnover in foreign exchange 
in 1998, nearly $900 billion was traded in forward transactions, approxi­
mately 60 per cent of the market. ln 1995, its market share was 56 per cent. 
Derivative instruments, which are concerned with forward transac­
tions of forex, include currency futures, currency swaps, currency options 
and Synthetic Agreements for Foreign Exchange. 

Forex markets are driven by a number of factors including relative interest 
rates, balance of payments, money supply, political factors and market 
sentiments. Rumors have a powerful impact on the forex market. The 
way the forex markets react to rumors could be summarized by the phrase: 
Buy the rumor, sell the fact! Speculation makes up the largest portion of 
trading in the forex market. The major participants in the forex market 
are banks as nearly two-thirds of daily foreign exchange transactions take 
place through interbank trading. Only a small portion of foreign exchange 
transactions directly involve non-financial customers who import and 
export goods and services. The rest of the transactions involve forex 
traders, forex dealers and securities firms. 

Although participants in the foreign exchange markets are spread all over 
the world. London is the largest foreign exchange trading ccnter, followed 
by New York, Tokyo and Singapore. The most actively traded currencies 

in the forex markets are US Dollar, Deutsche Mark and Japanese Yen. 
These three currencies together constitute 69 per cent of the global forex 
trade. Much of forex trading is carried out by a handful of dealers consist­
ing of banks and institutional investors. According to Euromoney, the top 
10 dealers are Citibank. Deutsche Bank, Chase Manhattan, Goldman Sachs, 
HSBC Midlands, JP Morgan, SBC Warburg Dillon Read, Merrill Lynch, 
Netwest and Industrial Banlc of Japan. 
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money is bought and sold dictates the economic policies of national 

governments and therefore affects the lives of billions of people. 

Why do we need forex markets? The main function of forex markets 

is to facilitate cross border trade and investment. As different countries 

use different currencies, forex markets convert one currency to another 

currency for cross border deals. Another function could be to hedge 

against 'the risk. Historically, much of the trading in foreign exchange was 

the result of international trade, as buyers and sellers of foreign goods and 

services needed another currency to settle their transactions. In the early 

1970s, about 90 per cent of forex transactions were related to trade and 

investment. But now, forex trading bas very little to do with international 

trade as most purchases and sales of forex are related to financial 

transactions rather than merchandise trade. In fact, forex trading has 

grown much faster than international trade in goods and services. In 

1997, the global volume of exports of goods and services wa~ $6.6 trillion 

($5.2 trillion of goods exports and $1.3 trillion of services exports). This 

comes to only approximately 4 days of global forex trade. If one compares 

global fore.x trade with the world GDP ($29.2 trillion in 1998), it is more 

than ten times the world GDP. Hence, the forex market is much bigger 

than all the other markets put together. These comparative statistics bring 

out the fact that forex trading has gained a life of its own as there is a 

growing delinking between forex transactions and real economic activities, 

with the former far exceeding the financing requirements of the latter. 

These statistics also reveal that speculation makes up by far the largest 

proportion of trading in the forex marker. 

But the foreign exchange markets are very volatile and therefore pose 

a systemic risk. As banks are involved in much of forex trading, they are 

exposed to large amounts of cross border settlement risk. Given the fact 

that national payment systems operate in different time zones, it is possible 

that after the first counterpart has delivered one side of the transaction. the 

other counterpart may go bankrupt and fail to deliver the offsetting 

currency. Because of increased inter-bank lending by international banks, 

a default by one large bank may cause a second bank to fall which in turn 
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may lead to a larger systemic upheaval in the international banking 

syst em . Thus, any debacle in the settlement of fo reign exchange 

transactions could have serious negative implications for the global 

financial system. 

The Emergence of Securities 

Besides global foreign exchange trade, the other important factor that has 

contributed to the spectacular growth in finance capital is the emergence 

of securities. Since 1980, the volume of trading in financial securities has 

increased phenomenally. The value of global financial securities is more 

than the value of annual world output. The total dollar value of all 

investment-grade securities worldwide that could potentially be issued is 

upward of $150 trillion, roughly five times the value of annual world 

output. 10 The growth of new fi_nancial instruments, such as derivatives, 

has funher increased the volume of trading. As there are no reliable 

statistics offinancial derivatives, it is estimated that the total outstanding 

notional value of derivative products was over $80 trillion in 1997. The 

world bond market has grown from $2 trillion in 1980 to $25 trillion in 
1998.11 According to Capital DATA (a company which monitors financial 

Table 1.3: US fnstitutional Investment 

Proportion of US equity market 

(in percentage) owned by institu­

tional investors 

Year % 

1950 6. 1 

1960 12.6 

1970 19.4 

1980 33.9 

1990 47.2 

1997 48.0 

Source: The LC1nferencc Board. 

Proportion of US equity market 

(net worth) owned by institu tional 

investors (1997) 

$bn 

Private pension funds 1709 

Mutual funds 1586 

Public pension funds I 213 

Bank and trust companies 803 

Insurance companies 303 

Other institutions 614 
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markets), 3850 international bonds were issued by the top 25 investment 

banks in 1998 alone. 12 Led by Merrill Lynch, Lhe top five leading issuers 
accounted for 37 per cent of the value of these bonds. " 

Mutual funds have also witnessed a massive expansion since the 
1980s. Mutual funds represent the second largest pool of private capital 
in the world after the banking industry. lt has been estimated that US will 
enter the 2lst century with halfof all households owning shares directly or 
througb mutual funds, compared with 25 per cent in the mid- l 980s and 
only 5 per cent in the l 950s. 14 While pension funds represent the third 
largest pool of private capital in the world, after the banking and mutual 
fund industry. The value of global pension assets grew by more than 60 
per cent, from $6 trillion in 1992 to $9.7 trillion in J 997.15 As far as hedge 
fund industry is concerned, they are estimated to be at least 5500, with 
$300 billion of funds under management, as of mid-1998. By and large, 
the increase in financial assets is more pronounced in the developed 

countries where the process of securitization has been .iccompanied with 
the development of international institutional investors. According to 
OECD data, the totaJ institutional assets of the main regions in the OECD 
domain rose from $3.2 trillion in 1981 to $24.4 trillion in 1995.11

' 

The rapid growth of financial securities, however, raises some critical 
issues. ln the recent years, there has been no parallel rise in the real 
economy del>pite the rapid rise in the value of global financial securities. 
In fact, the opposite is true because the growth in real economy has been 
the slowest in tJ1e post war period. In the US, for instance, where stock 
markets have .. vitnessed a massive boom in the 1990s due lo massive 
inflow of funds, growth in market capitalization has far outstripped the 
growth in output. Similar trends have also been witnessed in the 

employment and productivity growth rates in the US. 

The assumption that borrowers can raise funds directly from investors 
through securities rather than going to other sources is difficult to accept 
for two reasons. Firstly. the trillions of dollars flowing into financial 
markets account for resale or trading of stocks in secondary markets. The 
corporation issuing the stock does not get lhis money which goes to the 
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last owner of the stock. For instance, when shares of Ford Motor are 

bought and sold, tbe company's capital and physical assets do not change 

and there is no increase in it:. profits. What has changed is the ownership 

of the company. That is why many market observers argue that a more apt 

definition of institutional investors in securities should be institutional 

traders because they basically trade financiaJ instruments and know 

when to make a killing. Only a small part of these huge sums enters the 

corporate real economy in the form of new issues sold in primary markets. 

Even new issues may not contribute to additional investment if the 

proceeds are used to retire other domestic debt or fund current 

expenditures or are mobilized for speculative purposes by the corporation. 

Secondly, it is an established fact that banks are much more important 

when firms are building up a reputation. Once firms have established a 

reputation, only then equity and bonds markets have some role as providers 

of investment finance. Even in counlries with a high level of development, 
new equity finance plays a very minor role in providing finance for 

investment. A study of eight developed countries found that net financing 

raised through short-term securities, bonds and share!> is extremely small 

- less than 5 per cent. 17 By and large, corporations in most of the 

developed countries raise their financial resources internally. From 1945 

to 1995, US non-financial firms raised 75 per cent of their finances 

internally, 12 per cent from intermedfaries such as banks and 13 per cent 

from the security market.10 In the case of certain other developed countries. 

corporations raise fewer funds from the market, for instance, Germany 3 

per cent and Japan 7 per cent.19 In several studies, Ajit Singh of University 

of Cambridge has demonstrated that equity markets in the developed 

countries are not effective either in ensuring an efficient allocation of 

savings or in encouraging efficient decision making by entrepreneurs.lll 

ln the case of India, new equity raised in the market has declined over 

the years. According to the data provided by Centre for Monitoring Indian 

Economy, new equity raised in the market declined from Indian Rupees 

( Rs. ) 3470 million in 1994-95 to R~.I 150 million in 1998-99, even as 

market capitalization on the Bombay Stock Exchange registered an increase 
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from Rs.43340 million to Rs.54290 million over the same period. It is 
highly unlikely that equity tinance will play a significant role in the 
developing countries where equity markets are underdeveloped. Further, 
in several developing countries (e.g., India and China) where the tinancial 
markets had been Liberalized in the 1990s, corporations have raised lesser 
amount of funds from the market. Singh found that "there is little or no 
evidence of an increase in aggregate savings for most developing countries 
as a result of greater new issues activity on the stock market. In some of the 
countries {e.g., Turkey and Malaysia) aggregate savings actuaUy fell during 
the 1980s. "21 

Securitization poses new problems and threats to macroeconomic 
stability. Trading in securities is influenced more by speculation rather 
than by economic fundamentals. Rumors play an important role in the 
trading. Because of high liquidity, funds can move out quickly thereby 
causing a steep fall in the value of stocks, assets and exchange rates. A 
sudden loss of confidence among foreign i.nvestors can cause a dramatic 
outflow of funds thereby creating conditions of an imminent fmanciaJ 
crisis. This is precisely what happened in the recent Southeast Asian 
financial crisis. 

The Great Transformation of Global Banking 

The global banking system has witnessed a radical paradigm shift in 
recent years due to financial deregulation and liberalization. Historically, 
banks were the leading intermediaries but now non-bank financial 
intermediaries play a major role in the global financial system. As financial 
markets led by non-bank financial institutions have become more 
dominant than money markets, the power and influence enjoyed by the 
banks in the past has drastically weakened. Nowadays, banks compete 
with mutual funds and other non-banking financial institutions to anract 
funds. Thanks to mega mergers taking place in the global banking industr)', 
a trillion-dollar bank has now become a reality (see Box 1.3 ). In 1998, 505 
merger and acqujs1tion deals transferred $285 billion in market value 
and $1.22 trillion of assets, including megamergers of Citicorp-Travelers 



Recent Trends in Global Financial Flows 2 I 

l:f!ljll 
A $1000,000,000,000 Bank on the Cards? 

A trillion-dollar bank! In the past, it was almost impossible to imagine 
such a gigantic bank. Given the pace at which megamergers are taking 
place in the banking industry these days, the world will soon witness not 
one but several trillion dollar banks. The French bank, Banque Nationale 
de Paris (BNP) made a bid in early 1999 to buy two other French banks, 
namely, Societe Generale and Paribas. Interestingly, both Societe Generale 
and Paribas had just entered into a friendly merger when the BNP launched 
its bid. If the bid by BNP works out, it would create the world's biggest 
bank, with assets over $1 trillion. Some other recent megamergers include 
Swiss Bank with Union Bank of Switzerland; Citicorp with Travelers Group; 
Nations Bank with Bank of America; and Deutsche Bank with Bankers 
Trust. Except BNP, other megamergers could not produce a trillion-dol­
Lar bank though some arc inching toward it. It appears that merger mania 
never stops. as it becomes a self-perpetuating cycle. One merger deal leads 
to rise in share prices. which in tum, further provides the fuel for the next 
merger deal and so on, ad infinitum. 

In the race to the trillion dollar mark, Japanese banks are also not lagging 
behind. Under a major fmancial restructuring plan announced in mid-
1999, several megamergers between Japanese banks are on the anvil. If 
these megamerger deals proceed smoothly, Japanese banks may again 
become the biggest banks in the world, as was the case a decade ago when 
they reigned. The proposed tie-up of three big Japanese banks - Fuji 
Bank, Dai-Ichi Kangyo Bank and Industrial Bank of Japan - would cre­
ate the largest bank in the world in terms of assets worth $1.27 trillion. 
Similarly, the deal between Sumitomo and Sakura banks to merge by April 
2002 will create an entity worth $934 billion in assets. 

Whjle megamergers provide fodder for front-page stories in the newspa­
pers, a simple fact is often ignored that mergers pose new chaJJenges to 
regulatory authorities in terms of moral hazard. The complexity of big 
banks makes the task of managing risk more difficult. This became evi­
dent in 1998 when UBS suffered huge losses on account of bad deals in 
financial derivatives and lending to a hedge fund, LTCM. Recently, the BIS 
has come out with a critical study which found that mergers have failed to 
boost profits. Further, job cuts are an imminent fallout of every merger 
deal. Deutsche Bank's merger, for instance. with Bankers Trust was ac­
companied by a staggering downsizing of 5500 jobs. 
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Group and Nations Bank-Bank of America.22 With the emergence of 
universal banking, the trillion dollar banks would provide a range of 
financial services including stock brokerage, insurance, mutual funds 
and Internet banking. Megamergers of banks, in fact, have been facilitated 
by financial deregulation and therefore should be seen as an integral part 
of a bigger phenomenon. 

Largely because of increased competition and low margins in retail 
banking, banks have expanded their businesses in the last two decades. As 
a result, the distinction between the operations of commercial banks and 
non-banking financial institutions is getting blurred with the emergence 
of investment banking and universal banking. Similarly, many non­
banking institutions have now ventured into banking services. For 

Financial Intermediary is an agent who deals with the general puiJlic on 

the one side and the financial markets on the other. The important func­

tion of financial intermediary is to bring together economic agents who 

wish to save with those who wish to invest. 

Commercial Bank is a commercial institution that accepts depo~its and 

makes credit to private individuals, companies and other organizations. 

Investment Bank helps firms raise money in the financial markets. They 

underwrite issues by agreeing to bur unsold securities. They also advise 

their clients on mergers and acquisitions. 

Universal Banking involves not only services related to loans and sav­

ings but also those involved in making investments in companies. Well 

developed in Germany, the Netherlands and Switzerland, uni\'ersal bank­

ing system allows banks to act as investment banks and to provide a very 

wide range of other financial services to clients. 

UK Building Societies are involved in both lending and borrowing funds 

in the money markets since 1982. Jn their financial transactions, the build­

ing societies resemble high street banks. The first building society to 

become a bank in the UK was the Abbey National. 
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instance, building societies in the UK now offer cheque accounts. Likewise, 

the launching of financial and banking services by several business 

corporations (e.g., the General Electric of US and Tesco, a chain of 

departmental stores in the UK) has further intensified this trend. 

lo the past, several countries had adopted policy measures to prevent 

commercial banks from acting as universal banks providing different 

financial services such as investment banking and underwriting 

insurance. In the US, for instance, the Glass-Steagall Act of 1933 was 

enacted in the wake of the Great Depression of the I 930s to prohibit 

universal banking. Under the Act, commercial banks were prohibited 

from investment banking activities, such as undenvriting corporate 

securities, However, under pressure from market forces, the US repealed 

the Glass-Steagall Act in 1999. With massive financial deregulation, the 

o riginal separation between commercial and investment banking has 

been drastically eroded in recent years as banks now take up discount 

brokerage operations, sell mutual funds and provide underwriting and 
other investment services. Rapid changes in the financial sector (e.g., 

emergence offinancial derivatives) have also facilitated the diversification 

of banks into various non-fund businesses. Some banks have even 

diversified into the insurance services through mergers and acquisitions. 

[n Germany, for instance, a new type of banking called Allfinanz has 

emerged which offers life insurance, pension schemes and traditional 

bank deposits. The list of universal banks includes Citigroup, Deutsche 

Bank, Dresdner Bank1 Commerzbank and HSBC. 

On the other hand, investment banks (e.g., Morgan Stanley Dean 

Witter and Co., Merrill Lynch, Goldman Sachs and Credit Suisse First 

Boston) help corporations to raise funds in financial markets. They also 

advise their clients on mergers and acquisitions. Much of the income 

earned by investment banks comes from fees and commissions. As 

investment banks indulge in heavy risk businesses (such as financial 

derivatives), their profits are relatively higher. Notwithstanding the growing 

trend of commercial banks taking on investment banking services, there 

are few success stories. In fact, several big banks such as Citicorp and 
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NatWest have abandoned their investment banking operations. 

Recent experience, particularly in the context of the Southeast Asian 
financiaJ crisis, also raises criticaJ issues about the operations of investment 
banks. When the crisis broke out, severaJ investment banks were blamed 
for speculating on Asian currencies and thereby causing the crisis. But 
curiously, some of them have become advisors to the crisis-ridden 
countries. Goldman Sachs, for instance, is advising Thailand and Indonesia 

on bond issues and privatization while Lehman Brothers is a consultant 
to the Financial Restructuring Agency of Thailand that is selling off assets 
of closed finance companies. It is ironical that while advising the Thai 
authorities on restructuring, Goldman Sachs in collaboration with GE 
Capital was busy bidding to buy up the assets of 56 defunct finance 
companies. Since these banks have commercial enterprises in Thailand 

and Indonesia, analysts have pointed out that banks are pursuing their 
own business interests without any compunction. None other than 
Thailand's Finance Minister, Tarrin Nimmanahaeminda, has echoed this 
concern: 

These banks have an advisory side and a wheeler-dealer commercial 
side .. . They always say they maintain Chinese walls between them. I 
rather doubt it. Bow else would they be proving to their board that 
they are maximizing profits?n 

Financial Derivatives: The Source of Systemic Risks 

Another major development in the global financial system is the explo­
sive growth offinancial derivatives in the l 980s and the 1990s. In fact, the 
growth in derivative markets has been more dramatic in comparison with 
the equity and bond markets. Trading of derivatives in raw minerals and 
goods dates back to the nineteenth century, while fmancial derivali,res 

started in 1972 with currency trading. Stock-index futures trading began 
in 1982, and trading in interest- rate futures commenced in 1988. The 
derivative markets are not restricted to developed countries alone. A 
number of developing countries allow trading in derivative instruments. 
There are no reliable statistics pertaining to financial derivatives. From 

the end-March 1995 to the end-June 1998, notional amounts outstanding 
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in the OTC markets rose by 52 per cent touching $72 trillion, compared 

with $1 3.2 trillion outstanding in exchange traded foreign exchange and 

in terest rate derivatives which grew by 34.2 per cent, according to the la test 

estimates published by the IMF.24 

While financial derivatives a re supposed to belp reduce risk, they 

have becom e one of the biggest sources of volatility and instabili ty in the 

global fi nan cial markets. Derivatives pose additional risks because m any 

of the contracts are highly speculative thereby increasing the cha nces of 

heavy losses if a bet goes sour. Speculato rs play an important role in the 

trading of fi nancial derivatives. They keep buying and selling contracts 

Table 1.4: Markets for Selected Derivative Instruments, 1991-96 

Estimated am o unts outstanding at year-end (Sbn ) 

1991 t992 1993 1994 1995 1996 

Exchange traded instruments 3519 4634 7771 8863 9188 9885 

Interest rate futures 2157 2913 4959 5778 51:163 5931 

I ntcrest rate options• 1073 1385 2362 2624 2742 3278 

Cur rency futu res 18 27 35 40 38 50 

Currency options 63 71 76 56 43 47 

Stock marke t index futures 76 Ill) II 0 127 172 199 

Stock market index optK>ns 133 159 230 138 329 380 

Over the counter instruments 4449 5346 8475 11303 17713 24292 

Interest rate swaps 3065 3851 6177 8861 12811 

Currlo'm .. )' ~waps~ 807 860 900 915 Jl~i 

Other swap-rdated derivatives' 577 634 1398 1573 3705 

TotaJ 7968 9980 16246 20166 26901 341 77 

C"..ill' and puts. 
' Ad1u>ted for reporting of both cunencit>. 

Cap, , collars, floors and swaphons. 
!x1urcc· ;\urrtm/ Rrport, Bank for lnternauunJI Settlemtnb, 19%-97. 
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•:Mill 
Derivatives: Trader's Dream, Regulator's Nightmare 

A derivative product is a contract, the value of which depends on (i.e., 
'derived' from) the price of some underlying asset (e.g., an interest level or 
stock market index). Financial derivatives are financial contracts whose 
value is based upon the value of other underlying financial assets such as 
stocks, bonds, mortgages or foreign exchange. They are contractual 
agreements for future exchange of assets whose present value arc equal 
However, the value of the derivatives will change over the term of the 
contract as market valuation change the value of each side of the contract. 
The key element in these derivatives is that one can buy and sell all the risk 
of an underlying asset without trading the asset itself. 

Trading in financial derivatives is also distanceless and borderless. Finan­
cial derivatives are either transacted OTC or traded at exchanges. There are 
specialist exchanges (e.g., London International Financial Futures E.""<change) 

in which financiaJ derivatives are traded. However, in recent years. the 
value of OTC instruments has increased sharply as compared to exchange­
traded instruments. While exchange-traded instruments are strictly regu­
lated, OTC contracts are informal agreements between two parties and 
therefore carry heavy risk. The main users of financial derivatives are banks, 

forex dealers, corporate treasurers, institutional investors and hedge funds. 

Recent experience shows that financial derivatives are largely used as tools 
to make profits from speculation and arbitrage rather than to reduce ex­

posure to risk. From the nineties onwards, trade in derivatives has regis­
tered a rapid growth in terms of volume of trading and in the evolution of 
new and far more sophisticated instruments, giving rise to what is known 
as the 'derivatives of derivatives' syndrome. Due to these developments, it 
becomes a difficult task to regulate financial derivatives both at the compa­
ny's as well as state regulatory levels. Financial derivatives, therefore, are 
going to pose one of the greatest challenges for regulatory bodies in the 
2lst century. It is high time that regulatory bodies pay adequate attention 
so that an effective strategy to deal with the systemic risks posed by the 
financial derivatives can be chalked out. 

contd. 0 11 11ext page 
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The three forms of finanda1 derivatives are options, futures and swaps. 

Options are the rights (without obligation) to buy or sell a specific item -

such as stocks or currency - for a presct price during a specified period of 

tjme. The option can be freely exercised or disregarded, with no obligation 

to transact. Where the right is to buy, the contract is termed a Call Option; 
where the right is to seU, it is termed a Put Option. The holder of the option 

is able to take advantage of a favorablc movement in prices, losing only the 

premium payable for the option should prices move adversely. Trade in 

option contracts was long practiced between banks but developed after 

these began to be traded on the Philadelphia Stock Exchange in 1982. Currency 

options were introduced on the London International Financial Futures 

Exchange (LIFFE) and the London Stock Exchange in 1985. Options on 

three-month sterling futures were introduced on LTFFE in November 1987; 

trade in Japanese government bond futures began in JuJy 1987. Chief Centers 

for trade in options are the Chicago Board Options Exchange, the American 

Stock Exchange, and the European Oprions Exchange in Amsterdam and 

markets in Australia, France, Sweden and Switzerland. 

Futures are contracts that commit both parties to a transaction in a finan­

cial instrument on a future date at a fixed price. Unlike an option, a futures 

contract involves a definite purchase or sale and not an option to buy or 

seU. Often futures are used to speculate in the financial markets and there­

fore considered risky. A forward contract differs from a futures contract in 

the sense that each forward contract is a once-only deal between the two 

parties, while futures contracts are in standard amounts traded on 

exchanges. Unlike forward contracts, futures are traded face to face at 

exchanges and are regulated by the authorities. 

Swaps are agreements in which two counterparties undertake to exchange 

payments within a specified time period. For example, a UK company may 

find it easy to raise a sterling loan when they really want to borrow Deutsche 

Marks; a German company may have exactly the opposite problem. A 

swap will enable them to exchange the currency they possess for the cur­

rency they need. Recent years have witnessed explosive growth in currency 

swaps and interest rate swaps. The first currency swap was between the 

World Bank and the IBM in 1981. 
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fall o r remain stable. Instead the interest rates soared. Suffering huge 

losse:., tbe Orange County defaulted on its loan and went bankrupt. In 

addition. there was a $40 million cut in the county budget and consr­

q uently the government had to drastically slash the budget earmarked for 

social welfare p rograms for low-income population. Thousands of work­

ers, as a result, lost their jobs in Orange County. 

• Hnve you ever heard of losing $157 million on a deal involving $200 

million of borrowing? Jn 1993, Proctor and Gamble (P&G), a US con­

glomerate entered into a deal to reduce the interest costs on $200 million 

of loans. Under the deal, P&G's interest rates would vary according to a 
complex formula based on the yields of US Treasury bonds of different 

mat urities. The nominal value of contracts that P&G had entered into was 
$3800 million. Rather than falling, the interest rates in the US rose. By the 

time the managem ent of the company decided to extricate itself from the 

deal, it had suffered a whopping loss of $157 million. 

• In 1995, Barings Pk., Britain's oldest me rchant bank, suffered a loss 

of $1.4 billion when its Singapore based derivatives trader Nick Leeson 

built up large but uncovered positions in Nikkei 225 (Japan 's leading 

share index) futures contracts on the Osaka and Singapore futures ex­

changes. Lee!.on was convinced that the Nikkei would rise and Lherefore 

he placed one-sided bets on the price movement of Nikkei 225. However. 

due to the Kobe earthquake in January l 995, Japanese share prices col­

lapsed and Nikkei 225 fell sharply. Leeson continued trading and even 

increased his e;...posure after the earthquake. In February 1995, an inquiry 

ordered by the management to look into h is operations found that the 

bank had suffered huge losse~. Apart from the alleged fraud committed by 

Leeson, lax internal controls were found responsible for the huge Jos:.es. 

By forwarding nearly $890 million (more than half of its capital) to its 

Singapore subsidiary. Barings had violated the British and the European 

regulations which limit the funds to be used for any single purpo~e by a 
bank. 

• The Daiwa Bank ~uffered losses totaLing $1.1 billion whtn its New 

York-based bram:h's dealer Toshihide Jguchi carried out unauthorized 
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trading in US Treasury bond futures. The problem started when Iguchi 
made a $200000 trading loss in 1984. For over 1 l years, he continued 
accumulating $1. l billion of losses by falsifying records in such a manner 
that neither the Daiwa Bank nor the US Federal Reserve had any du 

about it. In July 1994, Iguchi finally informed the Daiwa Bank about hJ 

trading losses. 

• In 1998, Long-Term Capital Management (LTCM ), a hedge fund, 
suffered a huge loss of more than $4 billion. With the notional value of 

derivatives contracts exceeding $ J trillion, LTCM was bound to make 
substantial profits if interest rate spreads on bonds narrowed. However, in 
the aftermath of the Russian crisis, there was a stampede to 'safety' and 
yield spreads widened instead of narrowing. By September 1998, L TCM 
lost 90 per cent of its equity. For details, see chapter 4. 

Although much attention has been paid to the role of 'rogue trader' 
for incurring huge losses (e.g., Leeson of Barings and lguchi of Daiwa), 
three underlying factors behind many of these financial disasters have 

been largely ignored. Since financial derivatives are very sophisticated, 
risky and highly leveraged instruments, a sHght mishandling of trading 
can lead to huge losses. Secondly, there are serious weaknesses in the 
internal control and risk management systems within the banks and 

institutions involved in financial derivatives. LastJy, and perhaps more 
importantly, regulatory and supervisory authorities have lagged behind in 
foreseeing the risks involved in the derivatives trading particularly in the 
OTC derivative markets. There is no denying the fact that the central 
banks have intervened sporadically to avert the contagion effects of the 
financial disasters in the financial system. However, the real challenge 
before central banks and regulatory bodies is to curb speculative behavior 
and bring discipline in derivative markets so that financial disasters of 

such magnitude do not recur. 

Offshore Financial Centers and the 'Dirty Money' 

The world of offshore financial centers (which are also popularly known 
as 'tax havens') display the characteristic elements of•casino capitalism.' 



Taming Global financial Flows 

There is hardly any region in the world that does not have any oftshore 

financial center. Jn total. there are over 69 offshore financial centers in 

the world and the funds routed through these centers a.re huge. A large 

number of hedge funds, trust companies, shell companies and brokerage 

houses are located in offshore centers. Central to financial liberalization, 

these centers originated primarily for avoiding foreign exchange and 

capital controls. Closely linked with corruption and crime, these centers 

are the natural destination of 'dirty money.' Often used for money laun­

dering purposes, the offshore financial centers act as a tool to launder not 

only the proceeds of drug trafficking and other crimes but also aid and 

abet certain kinds of financial crime. The BCCJ scandal is one of the 

glaring examples of this phenomenon that shook the world's markets in 

the early 1990s. 

In a similar vein, the global hedge fund industry has witnessed tre­

mendous growth in the past decade. The total number of hedge funds 
operating worldwide is estimated to be 5500, with $300 billion of funds 

under management, as of mid-1998. A substantial number of hedge 

funds operate from offshore financial centers. Since the issues related to 

hedge funds and offshore fmancial centers are of special significance and 

are integrally related to deregulation, they have been examined in detail 
in chapters 4 and 5 respectively. 

Global Financial System: A Casino? 

The recent trends and developments in global financial flows, as dis­

cussed above. corroborate the fact that international economy has moved 

away from productive pursuits to those of finance. As the value of global 

forex trade is many times more than the value of annual world output or 

export of good~ and services, the global financial system resembles a 

casino in which asset:. are traded primarily for speculative profit rather 

than for the benefit of the real economy. That is why, many analysts have 

described this phenomenon as 'casino capitalism.'15 In fact, it is 'casino 

capitalism' that very often perpetuates economic disasters thereby ad­

versely affecting the lives of millions of ordinary people who have put 



Recent Trends in Global Financial Flows 33 

their savings and assets at its disposal. Even those who are not part of 
'casino capitalism' (e.g., poor people, workers, small traders. etc.) may noL 

be able to escape from its machinations as witnessed in the wake of the 

Mexican and the Southeast Asian financial crises. As Susan Strange puts 
it succinctly: 

For the great difference between an ordinary casino which you can go 
into or stay away from, and the global casino of high finance, is that 
in the latter we are all involuntarily engaged in the day's play. A 
currency change can halve the value of a farmer's crop before he 
harvests it , or drive an exporter out of business. A rise in interest rates 
can fatally inflate the costs of holding stocks for the shopkeeper. A 
takeover dictated by financial considerations can rob the fae1ory 
worker of his job. From school-leavers to pensioners, what goes on 
in the casino in the office blocks of the big financial centers is apt lo 
have sudden, unpredictable and unavoidable consequences for 
individual lives. The financial casino has everyone playing the game 
of Snakes and Ladders.!6 
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